
 

1 
 

 
Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/147 
 
Subject: Xray, CT & MRI Scans 
 
I can confirm that the CCG does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Please provide information for the following years (2017, 
2018, 2019, 2020, 2021): 

a. How many scans in total were performed each 
year: 

i. CT scans 
ii. MRI scans 
iii. X-rays 

b. How many elective scans were performed each 
year: 

i. CT scans  
ii. MRI scans  
iii. X-rays 

c. How many urgent scans were performed each 
year:  

i. CT scans  
ii. MRI scans  
iii. X-rays  

d. How many of the total scans performed were 
outsourced for reporting by a teleradiology service 
each year: 

The ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact the 
acute hospital trusts. 
 
North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT) –  
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-
information/request-information  
 
University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust 
(UHBW) – https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-
data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests 
 
For 1a (i & ii) - data for every commissioner and provider is publicly 
available and can be found in the monthly DM01 files published on 
the NHS Statistics website here: 
 
https://www.england.nhs.uk/statistics/statistical-work-
areas/diagnostics-waiting-times-and-activity/monthly-diagnostics-
waiting-times-and-activity/ 
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i. CT scans 
ii. MRI scans 
iii. X-rays 

e. How many elective scans performed were 
outsourced for reporting by a teleradiology service 
each year: 

i. CT scans 
ii. MRI scans 
iii. X-rays 

f. How many urgent scans performed were 
outsourced for reporting by a teleradiology service 
each year: 

i. CT scans 
ii. MRI scans 
iii. X-rays 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 10 January 2022 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Offier for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire CCG. 


