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Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/148 
 
Subject: Locum GPs 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1.    Please release the figures that show how many locum 
GPs worked in your integrated care area from 1st July to 
31st December 2022. Please break down the figures into 
the number of individual locum GPs, the total number of 
hours worked by these locum GPs and the total cost of 
these hours.  Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 

Board does not hold this information. You would need to contact 
each practice individually for this information.  
 
Practice contact information is available on the individual GP 
websites. A list of GP practices within the ICB footprint is 
included on our website: https://bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/health-and-
care/find-a-local-health-service/ 

2.    What was the highest amount paid to a locum GP for one 
shift in this period and how many hours did that shift last?  

3.    How many vacancies are there for full time GPs in your 
integrated care area? 

4.    Please release the average annual wage figure for a 
salaried GP in your integrated care area. 

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 January 2022 and has been approved for release by David Jarrett, 
Director of Integrated and Primary Care for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


