
 

1 
 

 
Reference: FOI.ICB-2223/195 
 
Subject: Memory Assessment Waiting Times and Contacts 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. On the 1st January, how many people from your ICS area 
who had been referred to an NHS memory service had not 
yet had an attended first contact? Please can this number be 
provided for the years 2021, 2022 and 2023, and broken 
down by the following waiting times between their referral 
date and 1st January in the given year: 

a) 6 weeks or less 
b) greater than 6 weeks and less than or equal to 3 months 
c) greater than 3 months and less than or equal to 6 months 
d) greater 6 months and less than or equal to 12 months 
e) greater than 12 months and less than or equal to 18 

months 
f) greater than 18 months and less than or equal to 24 

months 
g) greater than 24 months 

 
BNSSG ICB (Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire 
Integrated Care Board) does not hold this information and suggest 
the following: 
 
Memory Services are provided by two different providers in the 
BNSSG ICB area, therefore;  
 
For figures relating to the North Somerset and South Gloucestershire 
Area contact: awp.freedomofinformation@nhs.net  
 
For figures relating to the Bristol Area contact: 
dpt.saferinformation@nhs.net  

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 27 February 2023 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


