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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/076 
 
Subject: Pathology Laboratories 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Number of pathology laboratory test referrals per trust for 
your constituent trusts 

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 
Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information. 
 
We advise you to contact the acute hospital trusts directly: 
 
University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust 
(UHBW): https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-
of-information-foi-requests 
 
North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT): https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-
us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information 

2. Number of pathology laboratory test referrals completed 
electronically per trust (i.e., not through paper referral 
form)  

3. Number of pathology laboratory testing requests (no. of 
transactions) per trust 

4. Number of pathology lab sites under each of your trusts 
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5. The LIMS system currently used by your different trusts 

6. Number of pathology laboratories you refer pathology 
tests/requests to 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 18 May 2023 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


