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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/095 
 
Subject: Breast Cancer Screening and Diagnosis 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. How many patients have been screened for breast cancer 
within your organisation in the last 12 months? 

The ICB does not hold this information.  
 
We advise you to contact the North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT) Breast 
Cancer Service. 
 
NBT can be contacted via the following: foi@nbt.nhs.uk 
 
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-
information/request-information 

2. How many patients attended symptomatic clinics for potential 
breast cancer within your organisation within the last 12 
months? 

3. Over the last 12 months, how many patients has your 
organisation treated or screened for breast cancer with the 
following modalities?  

i. Mammography 
ii. Tomosynthesis 
iii. Magnetic Resonance Imaging (MRI) 
iv. Computerised Tomography (CT) 

4. How many mammography examinations have taken place in 
the last 12 months? 
How many of the above patients received contrast media 
enhanced mammography?  
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5. How many individual devices does your organisation have for 
patients to access within your geographical catchment area? 

i. Standard Mammography 
ii. Digital Mammography 
iii. Tomosynthesis 
iv. Magnetic Resonance Imaging (MRI) 
v. Computerised Tomography (CT) 

6. How many private providers offer access for potential breast 
cancer patients within your catchment area to the following 
modalities? 

i. Mammography 
ii. Tomosynthesis 
iii. Magnetic Resonance Imaging (MRI) 
iv. Computerised Tomography (CT) 

 
If yes to the above question, please can you name those 
providers? 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 June 2023 and has been approved for release by Lisa Manson, 
Director of Performance and Delivery for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


