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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/108 
 
Subject: Menopause Services 
 
I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

What was the longest a patient at one of the GP practices that 
fall under your Integrated Care Board waited for: (in 
weeks/days)  
1. First appointment at the menopause clinics or services within 
your organization or department. 
2. First treatment for menopause symptoms (if needed). 
3. First treatment for menopause symptoms, following a referral 
from a GP or specialist.  
4. First specialist appointment, following a referral. 
In each of the following calendar years – 2018, 2019, 2020, 
2021, 2022, 2023 (if available so far)?  

The ICB does not hold the information requested. 

Menopause is mostly managed within primary care with complex 
cases referred to the Acute Trusts.  
 
 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 27th June 2023 and has been approved for release by David Jarrett, 
Director of Integrated and Primary Care for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


