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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/238 
 
Subject: Spirometry Services 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. What proportion of GP practices are doing spirometry 
themselves for annual respiratory reviews?  

94% GP practices offered spirometry service during Apr-Aug 2023. 
We do not split out reasons for spirometry. 

2. What proportion of GP practices are doing spirometry 
themselves for breathless patients without a diagnosis?  The ICB does not hold this information. 

3. What proportion of patients on asthma and COPD 
registers have spirometry documented in the last 3 
years? 

The ICB does not hold this information. 

4. Do you use outsourced spirometry services to support 
primary care?  

a. If so, what are the names of the spirometry 
providers commissioned to deliver the service to 
your patients?  

b. If so, how many organisations have you contracted 
with in 2023/24 so far?  

No, we don’t outsource or contract separately for spirometry services 
as an ICB. 
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c. How much was spent in total procuring these 
services?  

d. When will you be recommissioning spirometry 
providers?  

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 29 September 2023 and has been approved for release by David 
Jarrett, Director of Integrated and Primary Care for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


