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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/406 
 
Subject: Late Effects of Cancer Services 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Please provide a list of all providers the ICB holds contracts 
with for Late Effects of Cancer services, which are variously 
(but not exclusively) described as: 
 

a. Late Effects/LE Service, Radiotherapy Late Effects 
Service 

a. Pelvic, Pelvic Radiotherapy, Pelvic Radiation 
Disease/PRD Late Effects Service 

a. Gastrointestinal & Urological, Gastrointestinal Late 
Effects Services 

a. Gastrointestinal Consequences of Cancer service 
a. Urological Late Effects Service 
a. Radiation Cystitis clinic 
a. Complex Cancer Late Effects Rehabilitation 

 
For each contracted provider, please provide the Service 
Specification that describes the service (whether standalone or 
integrated in a broader Service Specification). 

The ICB does not hold this information.  
 
We advise you to contact NHS England as the lead commissioner: 
https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/ 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 30 January 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


