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Reference: FOI.ICB-2324/478 
 
Subject: Primary Care Data Gathering Programme 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

The "primary care data gathering programme" is a national 
exercise delivered by Community Health Partnerships on behalf 
of NHS England. More details can be found here. Its results are 
published on the Strategic Health Asset Planning an Evaluation 
(SHAPE) place atlas here.  
 
1: Under the FOI act, can I please ask for the ICS for the full 
dataset for its system in the primary care data gathering 
programme in an excel format.  
 
 2. If it is not possible to share the full dataset, could I please 
receive all data (in an excel format) relating to  
 

a) backlog maintenance and  
b) size and age of GP premises for the system in the primary 

data gathering programme. 

1. The ICB does not hold this information, please contact NHS 
England - england.contactus@nhs.net 

2.  
a. The ICB does not hold this information, please contact NHS 

England - england.contactus@nhs.net 
b. Size of premises: The total amount of GP floorspace in BNSSG 

is 51,533.4m2 Net Internal Area. 
Age of premises: The PCDG database does not hold specific 
dates of building construction. We have GP buildings within our 
BNSSG with construction dates ranging from pre-1948 to 2018. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 22 March 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 


