Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/015

Subject: Tier 2/3/4 Weight Management Services

NHS

Bristol, North Somerset

and South Gloucestershire
Integrated Care Board

| can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION

RESPONSE

Tier 2

Tier 3

Tier 4

1) Please list all Tier 2, Tier 3 and Tier 4 weight management
services providers in your ICB. Where data is not readily
available, please provide as much data as possible within “the
appropriate limit” defined in Section 12 of the FOI Act:

Service providers

(Example: Ashford and St Peter’s Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust, Bedfordshire Hospitals
NHS Foundation Trust, etc.)

This information can be found on the BNSSG Remedy website:
https://remedy.bnssqg.icb.nhs.uk/adults/weight-management/



https://remedy.bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/adults/weight-management/
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2) Please indicate the total number of Tier 3 weight management
patients treated in your ICB over the past 5 years. Where data is
not readily available, please provide as much data as possible
within “the appropriate limit” defined in Section 12 of the FOI
Act:

Tier 3 patients treated (#)

2018/2019
2019/2020
2020/2021
2021/2022

2022/2023

Tier 3 patients treated (#)

2018/2019 275
2019/2020 R
2020/2021 e
2021/2022 (=
2022/2023 4

3) Please indicate the average waiting time from referral to
treatment (RTT) for Tier 3 weight management services over the
past 5 years, rounded to one decimal place. Where data is not
readily available, please provide as much data as possible
within “the appropriate limit” defined in Section 12 of the FOI
Act:

. . Average waiting time for Tier 3 services
Financial year
(weeks)

2018/2019

2019/2020

The ICB does not hold this information, please contact North Bristol NHS
Trust (NBT) directly: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
governance/freedom-information/request-information



https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
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2020/2021

2021/2022

2022/2023

4) Please indicate how many patients are currently, and at the end
of each financial year, on your RTT waiting list for Tier 3 weight
management services. Where data is not readily available,
please provide as much data as possible within “the appropriate
limit” defined in Section 12 of the FOI Act:

Total number of Tier 3 patients (#)

2018/2019
2019/2020
2020/2021
2021/2022
2022/2023

Present

The ICB does not hold this information, please contact North Bristol NHS
Trust (NBT) directly: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
governance/freedom-information/request-information

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 24 April 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove,
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.



https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information

