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‘ﬂ Healthier Together INHS

Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/122

Subject: UTI Tests and Appointments

| can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

1. How many UT]I tests were performed in last 12 months at
any location?
a. What is the cost of each dipstick test?

2. How many were sent to the lab for further testing?

a. How much is the cost per test for the lab?

The ICB does not hold this information.

3. What is the sample turnaround time back to the
GP/Diagnostic Centers? We would suggest that this information is held at individual practice

level.

4. How many UTI appointments were attended over the
most recent 12 month period?

5. How many of those appointments were DNA (Did Not
Attend)?
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6. How many patients were
a. 18 above/ under?
b. >657
c. Male?
d. Female?

7. Who would perform the Test (GP/Nurse/ Banding Level?)

8. How many UTI Confirmed/ Non-Confirmed patients
received antibiotics?

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 15 July 2024 and has been approved for release by Dave Jarrett,
Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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