Bristol, North Somerset

Improving health and care in Bristol, and South Gloucestershire
North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care Board

‘ﬂ Healthier Together INHS

Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/141

Subject: Finance Software System

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

1. The name of the supplier who implemented your finance
software system.

2. The installation date of your finance software system.

BNSSG ICB does not hold this information. NHS England are the

3. The contract expiration date for your current finance contract holders; therefore, we advise you to contact NHSE directly.
software system.

Details of how to redirect the request can be found here:
4. The total upfront installation and implementation costs for | https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/
your finance system, including software, consultancy,
training, and related expenses.

5. The total annual costs to run and maintain your finance
system.

Please can you also break down your annual costs by:
i.  Software licensing fees
i. Maintenance and support fees
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iii.  Hardware costs

iv.  Consultancy

v. Training

vi.  Other recurring expenses (please specify)

6. Do you have any plans to switch to a different finance
system or upgrade the current system?

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 30 July 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove,
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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