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Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/143 
 
Subject: CAMHS Tier 4 Beds and Patients 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

Current Beds 

1. In your ICB area: 
a. How many CAMHS Tier 4 beds are 

commissioned? Please give figures for each year 
from 2020 – 2024.  

b. How many CAMHS patients were admitted 
informally to Tier 4 beds? Please give figures for 
each year from 2020 – 2024 

c. How many CAMHS patients living have been 
placed out of area1?  Please give figures for each 
year from 2020 – 2024. 

d. How many CAMHS patients have been admitted 
to an adult psychiatric ward?  Please give figures 
for each year from 2020 – 2024. 

e. How many CAMHS patients have been admitted 
to a physical health ward due to a lack of 
availability of a Tier 4 bed in your provider 
collaborative area? Please give figures for each 

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire (BNSSG) ICB 
does not hold this information. 
 
We advise you to contact SWPC (South West Provider 
Collaborative) and / or AWP (Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health 
Partnership NHS Trust);  
 
SWPC - dpt.saferinformation@nhs.net 
 
AWP - https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information 

 
1 More than 50km away 

mailto:dpt.saferinformation@nhs.net
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information
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year from 2020 – 2024 and specify whether the 
bed was an adult or child physical health ward. 

Access Assessments   

1. We understand that access to CAMHS Tier 4 inpatient 
services is by way of an Access Assessment. Please 
provide details of the policy and procedure for carrying 
out CAMHS Tier 4 access assessments, together with 
any further documents pertaining to Access 
Assessments.  
 

2. Is there currently a waitlist for Access Assessments and if 
so, how many people are on the wait list in your ICB 
area?  
 

3. Have any Mental Health Act assessments, where it has 
been determined that the child needs compulsory 
detention, been overridden by access assessments in 
your ICB? Please give figures for each year from 2020 – 
2024.  

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 19 July 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 


