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Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/183

Subject: Child Obesity Clinics

| can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust

1. Which NHS organisations or Local Authorities within your | (UHBW) - https://www.uhbristol.nhs.uk/patients-and-visitors/your-
region are currently providing Child Obesity Clinics? hospitals/bristol-royal-hospital-for-children/what-we-do/paediatric-

nutrition-and-dietetics/clinical-specialties/obesity/

2. Does the region have plans to introduce new Child
Obesity CIin?cs? P The ICB does not hold this data, we advise contacting the NHS

) , , England Regional Team to clarify their intentions.
If so, please provide an estimated timescale

If so, in which NHS organisations or Local Authorities will | https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/
these Clinics reside?

3. The name of the person within the ICS, NHS organisation
or Local Authority who is responsible for managing Child
Obesity Clinics. The ICB does not hold this data — we advise contacting UHBW.

Please provide a contact email address if possible.

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 30 August 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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