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Reference: FOI.ICB-2425/224 
 
Subject: ME/CFS, Long Covid and POTS Clinical Services 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

Request details:  

For the following clinics/services:  

1. ME/CFS services (i.e., chronic fatigue syndrome or 
fatigue management services) 

2. Long COVID services (i.e., post-covid clinics)  
3. POTS clinics (postural orthostatic tachycardia syndrome / 

syncope - usually located within cardiology or a specialist 
autonomics unit).  

Provide details for each clinic/service within your ICB: 

i) Name of the service/clinic 
ii) Address/location 
iii) Telephone contact (for patient enquiries) 
iv) Email address (for patient enquiries) 
v) Public web-page 
vi) Name/position of the lead clinician of the service 

1.  
i) Bristol ME Service 
ii) The Lodge, Cossham Hospital, Lodge Road, Bristol, BS15 1LF 
iii) 0117 4145192 
iv) bristolme@nbt.nhs.uk 
v) https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/our-services/a-z-services/bristol-me-
service 
vi) The ICB does not hold this information, we advise contacting the 
provider for this detail - FOIArequests@nbt.nhs.uk 
 
2. The Long Covid Service is run by Sirona care & health in 
partnership with Bristol ME Service. Since April 2024, NHS 
England’s central Long COVID programme ceased as Long COVID 
services are now delivered as business as usual for the NHS. 
iii) sirona.longcovid@nhs.net 
iv) 0300 124 5395 
v) https://sirona-cic.org.uk/nhsservices/services/long-covid-service/ 
vi) The ICB does not hold this information, we advise contacting the 
provider for this detail - Sirona.hello@nhs.net 
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3.There is no designated PoTS clinic within BNSSG. GPs can refer 
appropriate patients to a Cardiology arrhythmia clinic.  
Further information about PoTS pathways can be found on Remedy: 
https://remedy.bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/adults/cardiology/postural-
orthostatic-tachycardia-syndrome-pots/ 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 27 September 2024 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
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