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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/075 
 
Subject: Wound Care Data Collection 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Wound Care Data Collection 

a. Does your ICB collect or receive data on wound care, 
particularly for chronic wounds (e.g. leg ulcers, pressure 
ulcers, diabetic foot ulcers)? 

b. If not, are there plans to do so within the next 12months? 
c. What specific data points are collected (e.g. wound type, 

healing time, product usage, care setting, clinical 
outcomes)? 

d. How is this data collected (e.g. electronic patient records, 
community health systems, audits)? 

e. Is data collection standardised across providers within 
your ICB footprint? 

a. Yes 
b. N/A 
c. Details relating to the Wound Care Information standard are 

available in the public domain : DAPB4086: Wound Care 
Information Standard - NHS England Digital & Wound Care 
Information Standard - PRSB; Full implementation required by 
September 2025. In addition, information is shared which 
indicates the clinic type. 

d. The ICB does not hold this information; please contact care 
providers in our ICB for more information 

e. The ICB does not hold this information; please contact care 
providers in our ICB for more information  

2. Data Usage and Sharing 

a. For what purposes is wound care data used (e.g. 
commissioning, performance management, service 
planning)? 

Information relating to how the ICB uses and shares information can 
be found on our Privacy Notice pages - Our uses of information - 
BNSSG Healthier Together 

https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/information-standards/governance/latest-activity/standards-and-collections/dapb4086-wound-care-information-standard
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/information-standards/governance/latest-activity/standards-and-collections/dapb4086-wound-care-information-standard
https://theprsb.org/standards/wound-care-standard/
https://theprsb.org/standards/wound-care-standard/
https://bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/contact-us/privacy-notice/our-uses-of-information/
https://bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/contact-us/privacy-notice/our-uses-of-information/
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b. Is this data shared outside your organisation (e.g. NHS 
England, research bodies, suppliers)? If yes, under what 
governance or agreements? 

3. Technology and Digital Systems 

a. What digital systems or platforms are currently used for 
recording and managing wound care data (e.g. EMIS, 
SystmOne, bespoke solutions)? 

b. Are there any current or upcoming digital transformation 
initiatives focused on wound care? 

a. EMIS is used in Primary Care 
b. No 

4. Spend and Commissioning 

a. Does your ICB hold data on spend related to wound care 
(e.g. dressings, devices, service delivery)? 

b. Are wound care services commissioned centrally by the 
ICB or delegated to Place or provider level? 

a. Wound care services are commissioned as part of a wider 
block contract for community services and as such the ICB 
does not hold data on spend related specifically to wound 
care.  This information may be held by Sirona care & health 
(hello.sirona@nhs.net)  

b. Wound care services are commissioned centrally by the ICB 
as part of the adult community services contract and as part 
of a local enhanced service for general practices, delivering 
care at practice level. Further information about these 
services can be found here: Tissue Viability/Wound Care 
Service (Remedy BNSSG ICB) 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 26th June 2025 and has been approved for release by Sarah 
Truelove, Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 

mailto:hello.sirona@nhs.net
https://remedy.bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/adults/dermatology/tissue-viabilitywound-care-service/
https://remedy.bnssg.icb.nhs.uk/adults/dermatology/tissue-viabilitywound-care-service/

