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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/076

Subject: Mental Health Data (ADHD, ASD, Dementia)

| can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION

RESPONSE

1.

What is the current average and 90th percentile waiting
time for ADHD post diagnostic therapies (including
psychotherapies), broken down by (a) NHS providers and
(b) outsourced private providers?

the NHS receive (a) medication titration and (b) follow-up
care within 3 months?

BNSSG ICB does not hold the data requested in questions 1, 2, 3, 4
and 5 and requests for this information should be directed to:

NHS provider (Adults):
Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership NHS Trust (AWP)
Bath NHS House Newbridge Hill Bath BA1 3QE

2. What is the current average and 90th percentile waiting awp.freedomofinformation@nhs.net
time for ASD post diagnostic therapies (including https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information
psychotherapies), broken down by (a) NHS providers and
(b) outsourced private providers? NHS Provider (Children & Young People)
3. How many ADHD referral requests were (a) declined and | Sirona Care and Health, Badminton Road Office, 27 Floor,
(b) deemed 'not clinically urgent' by NHS services in the Badrrlnntlon Road, Yate, BS37 SAF
last 12 months? https://sirona-cic.org.uk/contact-sirona/
. Contracted Private Sector provider (CYP & Adults):
4. How many A,‘SD refgrral request's were (a) dec_:llneq and Clinical Partners Limited, Unit 6, Chaldicott Barns, Tokes Lane,
(b) deemed 'not clinically urgent' by NHS services in the Semley, Wiltshire, SP7 9AW
f) ’ )
last 12 months? https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact
5. What percentage of patients diagnosed with ADHD by We do not hold contracts with any other private sector ADHD and

Autism providers, however, they may still see BNSSG patients under
the national “Right to Choose” framework and will need to be
contacted directly for the data they hold.
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6. Are any post-diagnosis services outsourced to private
providers? Which?

Post Diagnostic services aren’t commissioned in isolation and are
part of a wider ADHD and/or Autism assessment and treatment
pathway. This would take various forms including medication for
ADHD and signposting to other sources of support for Autism.
BNSSG ICB commission Clinical Partners to deliver an ADHD &
Autism assessment and treatment service.

7. What is the current waitlist time for dementia
assessment?

8. What is the split by demographics (under 60 vs over
60)?

BNSSG ICB does not hold this information. Please contact the
providers listed below:

For South Gloucestershire and North Somerset:

Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership NHS Trust (AWP)
Bath NHS House Newbridge Hill Bath BA1 3QE
awp.freedomofinformation@nhs.net
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information

For Bristol:

Devon Partnership Trust - Bristol Dementia Wellbeing Service:
dpt.ig@nhs.net
https://bristoldementiawellbeing.org/Use-our-service/Contact-Us

9. Which providers are you working with to support on
memory assessments (eg. dementia)?

Please can you share the spend broken down by
provider for FY24/25

Please can you share the spend broken down by
provider for FY23/24

Please see question 8 for provider information.

The ICB does not hold this level of information. Please contact the
providers directly who may hold this information.

10.What other mental conditions does the NHS use
private providers to deliver assessments for?

Vita Health Group are an independent sector health provider who
were awarded the contract to provide NHS Talking Therapies in
BNSSG in 2019. They support patients with anxiety and depression
which also may include:
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Agoraphobia

Body dysmorphic disorder

Generalised anxiety disorder

Health anxiety (illness anxiety)
Obsessive-compulsive disorder (OCD)

Panic disorder

Post-Traumatic Stress Disorder (PTSD)

Social anxiety disorder

Specific phobias (such as heights or small animals).

The remit regarding the above disorders are determined by NHS
Talking Therapies manual and NICE Guidelines.

Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership NHS Trust (AWP) are
sub-contracted by Sirona care and Health CiC to provide Child and
Adolescent Mental Health Services (CAMHS) through the Children’s
Community Health Partnership Contract. Kooth and Off The Record
are sub-contracted by AWP to provide Mental Health Support
services such as online support, Mental Health Support Teams in
Schools and Intensive Outreach Team. Services will assess the
needs of the child/young person and offer interventions as
appropriate.

11.Which providers are you working with for these
assessments?

Please provide a breakdown of all NCA spend by
category across mental health services for FY24/25

Please provide a breakdown of all NCA spend by
category across mental health services for FY23/24

23/24 24/25
ADHD Right to Choose £3,478,510 £5,709,654
Autism Right to Choose - £1,096,453
CTAD £21,773 £55,310
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CDS £55,033 £122,700

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 July 2025 and has been approved for release by Matt Backler,
Interim Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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