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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/094 
 
Subject: Cath Labs 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. The total number of cath labs in your ICB 

Each Trust in BNSSG (Bristol, North Somerset and South 
Gloucestershire) has a cardiac catheterisation laboratory: 
 

• North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT) - based in the Brunel building, 
Southmead Hospital. 

 
• University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation 

Trust (UHBW) - based in the Bristol Heart Institute (BHI) at 
the Bristol Royal Infirmary (BRI). 

2. The number of cath labs are in each Trust 
The ICB does not hold the information to answer these questions. 
Please contact the Trusts directly: 
 
NBT: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
governance/freedom-information/request-information 
 
UHBW: https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-
of-information-foi-requests 
 

3. The age of each cath lab 

4. Any plans to refurbish any of these cath labs 

5. The volumes of private cardiology activity done in these 
NHS cath labs 

6. Any trusts within the ICB considering procuring managed 
cardiology services 

https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
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7. Volume of NHS Cath lab and Outpatient Cardiology 
Activity last three years, broken by HRG code 

8. Volume of Private Activity last three years, broken by 
CSSD code 

9. Revenue of total NHS cath lab activity, last three years 

10. Revenue of total Private cath lab activity, last three years 

11. Private pricing schedules for all private cardiology 
activity, cath lab and outpatients 

12. Profit & Loss last three years for private cath lab activity 

13. Waiting list time by HRG code for cath lab procedure as 
of 1st June 2025 

14. Waiting list time for New Patient Consultation as of 1st 
June 2025 

Waiting time data (average wait) is available here at the speciality 
level My Planned Care NHS or for 90th centile waiting time data, at 
the speciality level see Hospital appointment waiting times - BNSSG 
Healthier Together 
 
For detail at the sub speciality level please contact the Trusts 
directly: 
 
NBT: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
governance/freedom-information/request-information 
 

https://www.myplannedcare.nhs.uk/
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/your-health/appointments-and-planned-care/hospital-appointment-waiting-times/?_specialty=Cardiology
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/your-health/appointments-and-planned-care/hospital-appointment-waiting-times/?_specialty=Cardiology
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
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UHBW: https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-
of-information-foi-requests 

15. Waiting list time for Cardiac CT as of 1st June 2025 The ICB does not hold the information to answer these questions. 
Please contact the Trusts directly: 
 
NBT: https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-
governance/freedom-information/request-information 
 
UHBW: https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-
of-information-foi-requests 
 

16. Waiting list time for Cardiac MRI as of 1st June 2025 

17. Waiting list time for Transthoracic Echo as of 1st June 
2025 

18. Waiting list time for ambulatory monitor fitting as of 1st 
June 2025 

19. 12 month and 24 month re-do rate of Atrial Fibrillation 
procedures 

20. 12, 24 and 36 month Morbidity and Mortality rate for PCI 

21. Residual book value of all cardiac assets in current 
inventory 

22. Any Outsourced work to IS providers and if so, the 
volumes of activity you outsource, and the revenue 
values of outsourced activity, on a line-by-line basis 

23. Are you interested to explore a managed clinical services 
solution in your ICB to support the potential reclaim of 
VAT on your consumables and/or the opportunity to 
release working capital through a ‘sale and leaseback’ 
(technology transfer agreement) of equipment and 
assets? 

No 

https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
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24. Are you interested to explore a ‘cardiology movement 
hub’, namely an IS provider developing an elective 
cardiology hub to provide cath lab procedures allowing 
the acute Trust in your ICB to concentrate on emergency 
and more complex activity to remove scheduling conflicts 
and so reduce waiting times? 

No 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 16 July 2025 and has been approved for release by David Jarrett, 
Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 


