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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/099 
 
Subject: AWP ADHD Assessment Service 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Please could I have information on the following 
regarding AWP ADHD assessment service: 

How many referrals are waiting for assessment? 

BNSSG ICB does not hold this information.  
 
Please contact Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership NHS 
Trust (AWP) directly at: awp.freedomofinformation@nhs.net 

2. How many of those referrals are in priority groups and 
how many are not in priority? 

3. Of people being assessed today, when were they 
referred? 

4. How many assessments are carried out per week? 

5. What is the anticipated wait time for a new referral? 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 30 June 2025 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
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