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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/128 
 
Subject: GP Consultation/Appointment Stats: Hypertension, Lipids, Cardiology 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

I would like to request data on the number of GP 
consultations / appointments in your practice for the fiscal 
years (1st April to 31st March) 2022, 2023 and 2024, broken 
down by the following categories:  

1. Total number of all GP appointments  

2. Number of appointments related specifically to 
hypertension (I10-I15; 38341003) 

3. Number of appointments related to lipid management or 
lipid-related conditions (including, but not limited to, 
hyperlipidaemia, hypercholesterolaemia)  (E78; 
48286001) 

4. Number of appointments related to cardiology-specific 
conditions, specifically:  

Please refer to requesters template enclosed.  
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o Coronary heart disease / Ischaemic heart disease (I20-
I25; 414545008) 

o Heart failure (I50; 84114007) 

o Arrhythmias (I44-I49; 698247007) 

For clarity and convenience, I have included both the 
corresponding ICD and SNOMED CT codes in brackets, 
formatted as (ICD code; SNOMED CT code). 

Please provide the number of appointments as raw numbers.  

If your practice does not routinely record these categories or if 
exact separation is not feasible, please supply the best available 
proxy or closest approximation.  

Please fill out your responses in the attached Excel spreadsheet 
and return the completed file via email reply. Many thanks for 
your assistance. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 31 July 2025 and has been approved for release by David Jarrett, 
Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 



Fiscal years (1st April - 31st March)
2022 2023 2024

Total number of all GP appointments 

Number of appointments related specifically to hypertension (I10-I15; 38341003)

Number of appointments related to lipid management or lipid-related conditions (including, but not limited to, hyperlipidaemia, hypercholesterolaemia)  (E78; 48286001)

Number of appointments related to cardiology-specific conditions, specifically: 
Coronary heart disease / Ischaemic heart disease (I20-I25; 414545008)

Heart failure (I50; 84114007)
Arrhythmias (I44-I49; 698247007)

This data is publicly available here: 
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-

information/publications/statistical/ap
pointments-in-general-practice/

The ICB does not hold this information. 
This may me held by individual 

practices. 
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