# Healthier Together NHS

Bristol, North Somerset

Improving health and care in Bristol, and South Gloucestershire
North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care Board

Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/165

Subject: Contract with and Clinical Management of Liaison Care

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

Following recent reports concerning the partnership between
the ICB and Liaison Care and its impact on NHS Continuing
Healthcare (CHC) assessments, | request the following
information for public transparency:

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2
F%2Fwww.bbc.com%2Fnews%2Farticles%2Fckgyk7d280yo&d
ata=05%7C02%7Cbnssq.foi%40nhs.net%7C7019cba87756467
9706808dde98a8616%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774¢ee
3%7C0%7C1%7C638923503396751089%7CUnknown%7CTW | BNSSG ICB (Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire
FpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIIYiOilwLijAuMDAw | Integrated Care Board) does not hold a contract with Liaison Care.
MClsllIAiQiJXaW4zMilslkFOljoiTWFpbClslldUljoyfQ%3D%3D%
7C40000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=q256FWarRUISXwQF3XMhytS
mIMrWjnGHjjaeNKvLjpM%3D&reserved=0

1. Contract Details:

Please provide a full, unredacted copy of the contract
between NHS Lancashire and South Cumbria ICB and
Liaison Care, including all appendices, schedules, and
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https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.bbc.com%2Fnews%2Farticles%2Fckgyk7d280yo&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7C7019cba877564679706808dde98a86f6%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C1%7C638923503396751089%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C40000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=q256FWgrRUl3XwQF3XMhytSmlMrWjnGHjjaeNKvLjpM%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.bbc.com%2Fnews%2Farticles%2Fckgyk7d280yo&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7C7019cba877564679706808dde98a86f6%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C1%7C638923503396751089%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C40000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=q256FWgrRUl3XwQF3XMhytSmlMrWjnGHjjaeNKvLjpM%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.bbc.com%2Fnews%2Farticles%2Fckgyk7d280yo&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7C7019cba877564679706808dde98a86f6%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C1%7C638923503396751089%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C40000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=q256FWgrRUl3XwQF3XMhytSmlMrWjnGHjjaeNKvLjpM%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.bbc.com%2Fnews%2Farticles%2Fckgyk7d280yo&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7C7019cba877564679706808dde98a86f6%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C1%7C638923503396751089%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C40000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=q256FWgrRUl3XwQF3XMhytSmlMrWjnGHjjaeNKvLjpM%3D&reserved=0
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https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.bbc.com%2Fnews%2Farticles%2Fckgyk7d280yo&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7C7019cba877564679706808dde98a86f6%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C1%7C638923503396751089%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C40000%7C%7C%7C&sdata=q256FWgrRUl3XwQF3XMhytSmlMrWjnGHjjaeNKvLjpM%3D&reserved=0

Bristol, North Somerset
Improving health and care in Bristol, and South Gloucestershire
North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care Board

‘ﬂ Healthier Together INHS

related documents defining the scope of services, key
performance indicators, and financial terms.

2. Clinical Governance and Staffing:

a. Please provide details of the ICB's clinical
governance and oversight process for Liaison Care's
services.

b. Please state the minimum professional qualifications
and experience in Continuing Healthcare required of
Liaison Care staff.

c. Please provide the number of full-time equivalent
(FTE) Liaison Care staff performing CHC
assessments for the ICB.

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 September 2025 and has been approved for release by Rosi
Shepherd, Chief Nursing Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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