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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/170

Subject: Transplant and Immunosuppressants Management in Primary Care

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

1. How many GP practices have hard transplant recipients
on the list, especially lung transplant recipients?
2. How many GP practices have experience with hard

transplant recipients, required the holistic approach? The ICB does not hold this information.

3. How many GP practices are experienced working with
immunosuppressant's used by transplant recipients? NHS England Specialised Commissioning are responsible for the

4. How may GPs are aware of the side effects of service. We advise you to contact NHSE directly for the information:
immunosuppressant's and masking other medical NHS England » Freedom of Information Act and Environmental
conditions? Information Regulations

5. How may fellowship members have participated in the "A
STAR training program at Harefield Transplant centre?

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 12 September 2025 and has been approved for release by David
Jarrett, Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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