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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/228 
 
Subject: Imaging and Pathology Networks 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

Imaging networks 

1. A list of all the active imaging networks in the ICB 
2. Which trust hosts each network? 
3. Who is the named lead for each network? 
4. Please also list any plans for future imaging networks or 

networks currently being developed 
5. Please also state the name of the staff member (if any) 

leading on developing networks/future plans 

The ICB does not hold this information. Please contact the Hospital 
Trusts directly, as follows: 
 
North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT): https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-
us/information-governance/freedom-information/request-information    
 
University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust 
(UHBW): https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-
data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests 

Pathology networks 

1. A list of all the active pathology networks in the ICB 
2. Which trust hosts each network? 
3. Who is the named lead for each network? 
4. Please also list any plans for future imaging networks or 

networks currently being developed 
5. Please also state the name of the staff member (if any) 

leading on developing networks/future plans 
 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 21 October 2025 and has been approved for release by David 
Jarrett, Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
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