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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/035 
 
Subject: Mental Health Conditions Data, Pathways and Spend 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. The number of individual patients treated in your 
ICB who are diagnosed, either as a primary 
diagnosis or a co-morbid diagnosis, with the 
following mental health conditions/available 
categorisation over the past five years/available time 
period: 

• Psychosis / Schizophrenia / Schizo-Affective 
Disorder 

• Treatment Resistant Depression 
• Bipolar / Cyclothymia / Hypomania 
• Eating Disorders 
• EUPD/CEN 
• Other 
• Diagnosis not recorded 

Count of distinct individuals (all ages) referred to secondary care mental health 
services by diagnosis group and year. Individuals may appear in multiple years but 
are counted in only one diagnosis group per year, even if they have multiple 
diagnoses. 
 

Diagnosis Group Codes used 2020 2021 2022 2023 2024 
Psychosis/Schizo
phrenia/Schizo-
Affective 
Disorder 

All SNOMED codes 
including Psychosis or 
Schizophrenia. ICD10 
codes - F20-F29 701 713 646 646 632 

Treatment 
Resistant 
Depression 

F32.2, F33.2, 
1153570009   38 34 27 26 26 

Bipolar/Cyclothy
mia/Hypomania 

F31, F34.0, F30.0, 
SNOMED like Bipolar, 
76105009 , 231496004  180 166 166 167 155 

Eating Disorders 

F50, SNOMED like 
'Eating' and Service type 
referred to C03, 
C09,C10 319 351 331 382 728 
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EUPD/CEN 
(Emotionally 
Unstable 
Personality 
Disorder, 
Complex 
Emotional 
Needs) 

F60.3, 191765005, (CEN 
no specific codes) 120 124 111 115 99 

Other n/a 1288 1248 1062 1098 1003 
Diagnosis not 
recorded n/a 21362 25421 26447 27526 28966 

 

2. The total number of admissions in your ICB 
involving the following mental health 
conditions/available categorisation, where 
individuals have been sectioned under the Mental 
Health Act over the past five years/available time 
period: 

• Psychosis / Schizophrenia / Schizo-Affective 
Disorder 

• Treatment Resistant Depression 
• Bipolar / Cyclothymia / Hypomania 
• Eating Disorders 
• EUPD/CEN 
• Other 
• Diagnosis not recorded 

Count of distinct secondary care mental health admissions (all ages) where the 
patient was detained under the Mental Health Act, and the section start date falls 
between 7 days before admission and the discharge date, grouped by diagnosis 
category. 
 
Due to small number suppression the 5 years have been combined. 
 

Diagnosis Group Codes used 
2020-
2024 

Psychosis/Schizophrenia/Schizo-
Affective Disorder 

All SNOMED codes including 
Psychosis or Schizophrenia. 
ICD10 codes - F20-F29 545 

Treatment Resistant Depression F32.2, F33.2, 1153570009   8 

Bipolar/Cyclothymia/Hypomania 
F31, F34.0, F30.0, SNOMED like 
Bipolar, 76105009 , 231496004  133 

Eating Disorders 

F50, SNOMED like 'Eating' and 
Service type referred to C03, 
C09,C10 31 
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EUPD/CEN (Emotionally Unstable 
Personality Disorder, Complex 
Emotional Needs) 

F60.3, 191765005, (CEN no 
specific codes) 25 

Other n/a 256 
Diagnosis not recorded n/a 760 

 

3. Does your ICB have a specialist care pathway, such 
as EIP (Early Intervention in Psychosis), that 
provides treatment for the following conditions: 

• Bipolar/Cyclothymia/Hypomania 
• Psychosis/Schizophrenia/Schizo-Affective 

Disorder 
• EUPD/CEN 
• Treatment resistent depression 
• Eating Disorders 

The ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact the provider, 
Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership NHS Trust (AWP), directly who may 
hold this: https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information 

4. If ‘yes’, please describe these care pathways. 

5. If ‘yes’, please provide the estimated annual spend 
for said specialist care pathways for each year / 
available time period, providing the name of each 
service, from 2019 to 2025. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 15 May 2025 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 

https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information

