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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/051 
 
Subject: Peninsula Purchasing and Supply Alliance (PPSA) Enteral Feeds Tender 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

I would like to request via freedom of information data on the last completed tender for 
 

• Bristol: PPSA - Enteral Feeds - BWPC – Tender 

I would like to know the following what prices were submitted by 
all competitors for all consumables when the last tender was 
published or at least the winning price . This should in include 
but not limited to the following 

i. Feeding Pumps  

• Acute and community 
ii. Feeding Sets 

• Acute and community 
iii. Feed all type 
iv. SIP feed all types 

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 
Board does not hold this information.  
 
We advise you to contact the provider, University Hospitals Bristol 
and Weston NHS Foundation Trust (UHBW), directly for this 
information. 
 
UHBW contact details can be found via the link: 
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-
information-foi-requests 

Also what was the annual spend on the tender over the last 4 
years. 

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 18 June 2025 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
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