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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/060 
 
Subject: Tier 3 Weight Loss Treatment 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. How many patients do you have that have been referred 
onward to a tier three weight loss treatment service?  

Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire Integrated Care 
Board (BNSSG ICB) does not hold this information.  
 
Please contact the providers directly as follows:  

  
• North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT): Freedom of Information Act 

2000 | North Bristol NHS Trust 
• Oviva: https://oviva.com/uk/en/contact/  

2. How many patients have been given a form of advice, but 
have not been referred to a tier three weight loss 
treatment service?  

The ICB does not hold this data. This may be held by the providers 
detailed above.  

3.  

a) How many patients do you have on a waiting list, waiting 
to access tier three treatment?  

b) What is the mean time patients have been waiting on a 
tier three waiting list?  

c) What is the longest a patient has had to wait?  

Please refer to question 1 response.  

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 June 2025 and has been approved for release by Sarah Truelove, 
Deputy Chief Executive and Chief Finance Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 

https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information
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