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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/261

Subject: eConsult Governance and Local DPIA Compliance at Courtside Surgery

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION RESPONSE

1. Copies of any guidance, circulars, or instructions issued
by the ICB to GP practices about carrying out local
DPIAs or six-month information-governance reviews for
eConsult, following the national NHS England DPIA (May
2020).

The ICB has not sent any guidance, circulars, or instructions to GP
practices about carrying out local DPIAs or six-month information-
governance reviews. Practices are the data controllers under UK
GDPR. The ICB has commissioned a DPO service for practices to
support them with DPIAs.

2. Any correspondence, assurance returns, or confirmations
received from Courtside Surgery showing they:

a) completed a local DPIA; The ICB has not requested any assurance returns, or confirmations
b) carried out the six-month review; from Courtside Surgery for the points listed.
c) registered eConsult on their Information Asset
Register.
3. Any internal audit reports, compliance checks, or The ICB does not hold any internal audit reports, compliance checks,
monitoring documents the ICB holds concerning or monitoring documents concerning Courtside Surgery’s handling or

Courtside Surgery’s handling or governance of eConsult.

governance of eConsult.

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 20 November 2025 and has been approved for release by David
Jarrett, Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.
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