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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/277 
 
Subject: Renal Network Affiliation, Structure and Performance Metrics 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. Renal Network Membership 

Can you confirm which renal network your ICB is 
affiliated with?  Can this include the geographical region 
and name of the renal network please 

The South West Renal Network is hosted by Royal Devon University 
Healthcare NHS Foundation Trust (RDU), and can be contacted 
here: rde-tr.southwestrenalnetwork@nhs.net  

2. Other ICBs in the Network 

Can you confirm which other ICBs are members of the 
same renal network? 

The South West Renal Network covers all ICBs in the South West, 
however this should be confirmed with RDU as the host 
organisation. 

3. Trusts in the Network 

Can you confirm which NHS Trusts are part of this renal 
network? 

For BNSSG ICB we advise contacting the trusts directly for 
confirmation; North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT), and University 
Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation Trust (UHBW) for 
Paediatrics. 
 
NBT: FOIArequests@nbt.nhs.uk 
 
UHBW: FreedomOfInfo@uhbw.nhs.uk 
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4. Responsible Personnel 

Please provide the names and/or roles of the responsible 
individuals for leading or coordinating the renal network 
within your ICB or region.  For each responsible person, 
can you provide their therapy area speciality. 

The ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact 
RDU directly.   

5. Clinical Scope and Function 

What clinical services or pathways does the Renal 
Network oversee or support (e.g., integrated care for 
patients with diabetes and CKD, heart failure 
management, etc.)? 

The ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact 
RDU directly.   

6. Performance Metrics 

What metrics are used to assess the performance of the 
renal network? 

(e.g., dialysis occupancy, transplant access, CKD 
progression rates, patient experience indicators). 

Please provide any service specifications relevant to the 
network 

The ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact 
RDU directly.   

7. Available Performance Data 

Please provide any available performance data or reports 
relating to the renal network’s activities or outcomes. 

The ICB does not hold this information. We advise you to contact 
RDU directly.   

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 9 December 2025 and has been approved for release by David 
Jarrett, Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 


