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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/336 
 
Subject: Terminal Illness and Housing Conditions  

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. For the most recent three financial years for which data is 
held, please provide: 
 
The number of patients recorded as receiving end of life or 
palliative care whose housing was documented by NHS staff as 
 
a. unsafe or unfit for habitation 
 
b. affected by damp, mould, overcrowding or serious disrepair 
 
c. temporary accommodation or homelessness 
 

The ICB does not hold this information.  
 
We advise you to contact the following providers of End of Life care 
who may hold this information: 
 

• St Peter’s Hospice 
• Children’s Hospice Southwest 
• The Jessie May Trust 
• Marie Curie 
• Weston Hospicecare 
• Bristol NHS Group; NBT (North Bristol NHS Trust) and UHBW 

(University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation 
Trust), who can be contacted as follows: 
FOIArequests@nbt.nhs.uk and FreedomOfInfo@uhbw.nhs.uk 

• Sirona care & health: Sirona.hello@nhs.net 

2. The number of cases where housing conditions were 
recorded as contributing to 
 
a. delayed discharge from hospital 
 
b. inability to provide safe end of life care at home 
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3. The number of patients receiving end of life or palliative care 
who died in hospital where housing conditions were noted as a 
factor in discharge planning or care decisions. 
 
If question 3 cannot be answered in this form, please instead 
provide: 
 
The number of patients receiving end of life or palliative care 
who died in hospital following a delayed discharge, where 
housing conditions were noted as a contributing factor. 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 13 January 2025 and has been approved for release by David 
Jarrett, Chief Delivery Officer for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 


