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Reference: FOI.ICB-2526/369

Subject: Neurodivergent Assessment Services Data 2023-2026

| can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below:

QUESTION

RESPONSE

assessment services:

Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, | request the following information regarding neurodivergent (ADHD and autism)

1. For each NHS provider currently
commissioned to deliver
neurodivergent assessment services in
your area, what is the total annual
contract value for:

2023/24
2024/25
2025/26 (to date)

If block contracts cover multiple services
beyond neurodivergent assessments, please
provide the total contract value and indicate
what proportion or percentage relates to
neurodivergent assessment services.

Provider 2023/24 2024/25 2025/26
Sirona care and Total contract value: Total contract value: Total contract value:
£49,565,678 £54,745,275 £55,954,312

health

Neurodivergent
assessment services
form part of a wider
block contract and as
such we are unable to
provide individual
service values. The
contract outlines the
range of services that
the provider is
expected to deliver and
performance is
managed by reviewing
outcomes. The
provider decides how
to distribute the money

Neurodivergent
assessment services
form part of a wider
block contract and as
such we are unable to
provide individual
service values. The
contract outlines the
range of services that
the provider is
expected to deliver and
performance is
managed by reviewing
outcomes. The provider
decides how to
distribute the money

Neurodivergent
assessment services
form part of a wider
block contract and as
such we are unable to
provide individual
service values. The
contract outlines the
range of services that
the provider is
expected to deliver and
performance is
managed by reviewing
outcomes. The provider
decides how to
distribute the money

Together we are BNSSG




NHS

Bristol, North Somerset
and South Gloucestershire

Integrated Care Board

‘ﬂ Healthier Together

Improving health and care in Bristol,
North Somerset and South Gloucestershire

based on the services
they need to deliver.

based on the services
they need to deliver.

based on the services
they need to deliver.

Clinical partners

No contract in place

Contract began 1st
December 2024
This is a zero-based
contract paid by
activity.

This is a zero-based
contract paid by
activity.

AWP

Total contract value:
£147,333,103
Neurodivergent
assessment services
form part of a wider
block contract and as
such we are unable to
provide individual
service values. The
contract outlines the
range of services that
the provider is
expected to deliver.
The provider decides
how to distribute the
money based on the
services they need to
deliver.

Total contract value:
£159,049,643
Neurodivergent
assessment services
form part of a wider
block contract and as
such we are unable to
provide individual
service values. The
contract outlines the
range of services that
the provider is
expected to deliver.
The provider decides
how to distribute the
money based on the
services they need to
deliver.

Total contract value:
£162,749,207
Neurodivergent
assessment services
form part of a wider
block contract and as
such we are unable to
provide individual
service values. The
contract outlines the
range of services that
the provider is
expected to deliver.
The provider decides
how to distribute the
money based on the
services they need to
deliver.

2. What is the total spending on Right to
Choose activity (payments to
private/independent sector providers)
for neurodivergent assessments for:

2023/24
2024/25

Information for 2023-24 and 2024-25 has previously been requested via the Freedom
of Information scheme and a link to the response can be found here: FOI.ICB-
2526/123: ADHD and Autism Assessments and Post-diagnostic Services

For 2025/26 the invoices paid as at 31 Jan 2026 is £11,346,549 (both CYP and
Adults). The ICB are unable to split out the spend for assessments only.

Together we are BNSSG



https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/FOI.ICB-2526_123-ADHD-Autism-assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2025/08/FOI.ICB-2526_123-ADHD-Autism-assessments-Final-Response.pdf
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2025/26 (to date)

3. How many neurodivergent
assessments were completed by NHS-
commissioned providers for:

The ICB does not own this information, and the requester is advised to contact the
providers directly:

e AWRP for adult assessments: https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact us/freedom-
information

e Sirona care and health for Children and Young People (CYP) assessments (0-
18 years): Sirona.hello@nhs.net

The ICB does hold some information for Clinical Partners relating to Quarter 4 2024-25
and Quarter 1 & 2 2025-26. This aligns with the start date of the contract. We do not

2023/24 yet have the reporting for Quarter 3 2025-26.

2024/25 Month Adult ADHD Adult Autism CYP ADHD CYP Autism

2025/26 (to date) Jan-25 17 16 4 17
Feb-25 33 15 10 23
Mar-25 23 19 15 42
Apr-25 25 28 14 40
May-25 18 12 3 35
Jun-25 23 19 17 51
Jul-25 46 11 28 40
Aug-25 42 20 17 21
Sep-25 42 21 12 30

4. How many neurodivergent
assessments were paid for via Right to
Choose providers for:

2023/24

The ICB has applied Section 12 to this this question as answering would take over 18
hours. Many providers offer multiple services including assessment and frequently
consolidate all activity onto one invoice. To answer this question would require manual

Together we are BNSSG



https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact%20us/freedom-information
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact%20us/freedom-information
mailto:Sirona.hello@nhs.net
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2024/25
2025/26 (to date)

This should be available from invoicing data
even if individual patient-level data is not
routinely collected by ICB.

counting of every invoice received since 15t April 2023 to the present day to draw out
assessment numbers from other activity and this would take over 18 hours to complete.

The team have identified that a significantly reduced timeframe may allow the team to
provide this data and have suggested a time period of a month. Please let the BNSSG
ICB FOI team know if you would like to receive this data and please specify the month
you would like the data for.

5. What were the average waiting times
from referral to assessment for NHS-
commissioned neurodivergent
assessments for:

2023/24
2024/25
2025/26 (most recent data)

As part of the neurodiversity transformation programme, average wait times for
children’s ADHD and Autism were calculated. This information is available on the ICB
website: Neurodiversity Transformation Programme: Autism and ADHD assessment
capacity and waiting times - BNSSG Healthier Together

Sirona care & health display waiting times for their services on their website: Waiting
times - Sirona care & health

The ICB does not hold average waiting time data for the periods requested but does
receive performance data on the number of children waiting by length of wait/waiting
band. Most recent performance data is as follows (Dec 2025):

Together we are BNSSG

If ICB does not hold this data directly, please 18 weeks | 19-25 26-51 52-77 78-103 Over 104
provide the most recent waiting time data and weeks weeks weeks weeks weeks
reported by commissioned providers. under

CYP 311 208 700 466 418 600

ADHD

(Sirona)

CYP ASD |410 148 691 515 485 1753

(Sirona)

4



https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/our-work/neurodiversity-transformation-programme/autism-and-adhd-assessment/
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/our-work/neurodiversity-transformation-programme/autism-and-adhd-assessment/
https://sirona-cic.org.uk/home/waiting-times/
https://sirona-cic.org.uk/home/waiting-times/
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23/24 24/25 25/26
Evolve Psychology Evolve Psychology Psicon Ltd
Axia ASD Ltd Provide Wellbeing Ltd | ADHD 360
Psicon Ltd RTN Mental Health Solutions
Clinical Partners KT Healthcare
ADHD 360 Paloma Health
RTN Mental Health Provide Wellbeing
Solutions Help for Psychology
Evolve Psychology
6. Please provide a complete list of all Clinical Partners

providers that have invoiced your ICB

) Oakdale Therapies
for neurodivergent assessment

Owl Therapy Centre

services for:
ATROM MINDCARE LIMITED
2023/24 AXIA ASD LTD
2024/25 CENTRE FOR ADHD
RESEARCH AND
2025/26 (to date) EXCELLENCE (THE)

HARROW HEALTH CIC
HEALTHHARMONIE LTD
HOLISTIC ADHD SOLUTIONS
LTD

JAJAWI & ASKER LTD

MIND PROFESSIONALS
LIMITED

PROVIDE ENTERPRISES
LTD

PSYCH-UK LTD
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RTN MEDICAL LTD
SKYLIGHT PSYCHIATRY LTD
TELEDOCTOR LTD

The information provided in this response is accurate as of 20 February 2026 and has been approved for release by Helena
Fuller, Deputy Director of Business, Strategy & Planning for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB.

Together we are BNSSG



