
 

 
1 

 
 

 

Reference: FOI.ICB-2627/032 
 
Subject: Stroke Rehabilitation 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

Please could I request, under the Freedom of Information Act 
2000, the average wait time (in days) between hospital 
discharge and the first community-based  

a) physiotherapy,  
b) speech and language therapy and  
c) occupational therapy session for stroke patients across 

the ICB 
 
Clarification: For 2025 and 2026 please 

The ICB does not hold this information.  
 
We advise you to contact the provider Sirona care & health who may 
hold the data; Sirona care & health_contact us  

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 12 May 2026 and has been approved for release by Caroline Dawe, 
Deputy Director of Performance and Delivery, Acute and Integrated Care, MHLDA and EPRR for NHS Bristol, North Somerset 
and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 

https://sirona-cic.org.uk/contact-sirona/#:%7E:text=0300%20125%206789*-,For%20other%20queries,-%3A

