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Reference: FOI.ICB-2627/039 
 
Subject: Gender Dysphoria Services 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

1. How many people in our area received surgical treatment 
options for gender dysphoria in 
2020/2021/2022/2023/2024/2025 and so far this year. 

2. Please break down the data by surgery type as specified 
here by the NHS: https://www.nhs.uk/conditions/gender-
dysphoria/treatment/ 
 

3. Please also break down the data by age group if possible 
(below 18, 18-25, 25-35, 35-45 and 45 and above).   

The ICB does not hold this information. 
 
We advise you to contact NHS England who may hold this data; 
https://www.england.nhs.uk/contact-us/foi/ / 
england.contactus@nhs.net 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 30 April 2026 and has been approved for release by Rosi Shepherd, 
Chief Clinical Leadership and Delivery Officer (Nursing) for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fwww.nhs.uk%2Fconditions%2Fgender-dysphoria%2Ftreatment%2F&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7Ce4ff477df9d04aa0000c08dea5e68f9b%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639130606888685605%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=XQQv49u412n3ofzA01%2Fm0l27VyVKY6i7cpVLseiJA9M%3D&reserved=0
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