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Reference: FOI.ICB-2627/041 
 
Subject: Autism and ADHD Referrals and Wait Lists (Adults and Children) 

I can confirm that the ICB does hold some of the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

I am writing to you under the Freedom of Information Act 2000 to request the following information regarding ADHD and autism treatment 
in our area. 

I have seen the ICB has recently shared some data here on another request. Following on this, I would like to request the following:  

1. The number of under 18s and adults waiting for an ADHD 
assessment in 2021/2022/2023/2024/2025 and so far this 
year.  

Please break down the data by year, age group and, if 
possible, gender. 

The ICB holds some data for one commissioned provider, Clinical 
Partners, which covers the period 1 January 2025 to 31 March 2026. 
The provider has held a contract with BNSSG ICB since 1 December 
2024, waiting list numbers from before this date are not held by the 
ICB. Waiting list data for December 2025 is also not held by the ICB as 
reporting reflects a complete quarter (e.g. 1 January – 31 March) and it 
is broken down between Children and Adults.   
 
We do not hold data at a more granular level (e.g. specific ages, 
gender). The requester is advised to contact Clinical Partners directly 
for this information: https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact   
 
 24-25 25-26 

 Q4 Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4 
Adult ADHD assessments 252 750 1022 1154 1498 
CYP ADHD assessments 286 760 1167 1398 1528 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fbnssghealthiertogether.org.uk%2Fwp-content%2Fuploads%2F2026%2F03%2FFOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf&data=05%7C02%7Cbnssg.foi%40nhs.net%7Ce15cf2628dc54de785a308dea5e8e151%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C1%7C639130616787613856%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=SF2xrX%2BKoGCNlSK2yZmZbd3xpPvEE7mA46cV1R%2B%2F%2FWc%3D&reserved=0
https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact
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For AWP services, please refer to the information contained in 
FOI.ICB-2526/402 FOI.ICB-2526/402: Right to Choose Framework for 
Adult ADHD and Autism Assessments BNSSG ICB does not hold 
historic waiting list data to cover the other periods requested and 
therefore, the requester is advised to contact Avon and Wiltshire Mental 
Health Partnership (AWP) NHS Trust directly for this: 
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information  
 
The ICB holds some data for Sirona care and health CiC, who provide 
Autism assessments and treatments for children and young people 
through the Children’s Community Health Partnership contract, see 
table below. For further information please contact the providers 
directly; Sirona care and health (hello.sirona@nhs.net) and Clinical 
Partners Contact us | Clinical Partners 
 
 18 

weeks 
and 
under 

19-25 
weeks 

26-51 
weeks 

52-77 
weeks 

78-103 
weeks 

Over 
104 
weeks 

Sirona 
CYP 
ADHD 
(February 
2026 data 
reported 
in March 
2026) 

334 125 636 564 355 689 

https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information
mailto:hello.sirona@nhs.net
https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact-us/
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As per the previous response FOI.ICB-2526/402: Right to Choose 
Framework for Adult ADHD and Autism Assessments, BNSSG ICB 
does not hold waiting list data for providers delivering services in the 
area under Right to Choose.   
 
BNSSG ICB is aware of the following Right to Choose eligible providers 
of adult and CYP ADHD assessment: 
 

Adult ADHD  CYP ADHD 
ADHD 360  ADHD 360 

Atrom Mindcare Ltd  Evolve Psychology 
Berkeley Psychiatrists  Healios 
The Centre for ADHD 

Research & Excellence 
(CARE ADHD) 

 
Health Harmonie Minds 

Dr J & Colleagues  Held Health 
Harley Street Mental Health  Help for Psychology Services 

Harrow Health CIC  Oakdale Therapies 
Healios  The Owl Centre 

Health Harmonie Minds  Psicon 
Innovate ADHD   

Insight Diagnostics   
Oakdale Therapies   

The Owl Centre   
Problem Shared   

Psicon   
Psychiatry UK   
RTN Medical   

https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf


 

 
4 

 
 

Sinclair Strong Consultants   
Skylight Psychiatry   

 
This list was last updated on 26-27 March 2026. 
 
Some nationally published data may also be helpful: 
https://commonslibrary.parliament.uk/research-briefings/cbp-10551/ 
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/mi-
adhd  

2. The number of under 18s and adults waiting for an 
autism assessment in 2021/2022/2023/2024/2025 and so 
far this year.  

Please break down the data by year, age group and, if 
possible, gender. 

The ICB holds some data for one commissioned provider, Clinical 
Partners, which covers the period 1 January 2025 to 31 March 2026. 
The provider has held a contract with BNSSG ICB since 1 December 
2024. Waiting list numbers from before this date are not held by the 
ICB.  
 
Waiting list data for December 2025 is also not held by the ICB as 
reporting reflects a complete quarter (e.g. 1 January – 31 March) and it 
is broken down between Children and Adults.  We do not hold data at a 
more granular level (e.g. specific ages, gender).  
 
The requester is advised to contact Clinical Partners directly for this 
information https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact    
 
  24-25 25-26 

 Q4 Q1 Q2 Q3 Q4 
Adult Autism assessments 170 366 549 634 826 
CYP Autism assessments 411 693 912 1034 1097 

 

https://commonslibrary.parliament.uk/research-briefings/cbp-10551/
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/mi-adhd
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-information/publications/statistical/mi-adhd
https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact
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For Avon and Wiltshire Mental Health Partnership (AWP) NHS Trust 
services, please refer to the information contained in previous response 
FOI.ICB-2526/402: Right to Choose Framework for Adult ADHD and 
Autism Assessments  
 
BNSSG ICB does not hold historic waiting list data to cover the other 
periods requested and therefore, the requester is advised to contact 
AWP directly for this: https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-
information  
 
The ICB holds some data for Sirona care and health CiC, who provide 
Autism assessments and treatments for children and young people 
through the Children’s Community Health Partnership contract, see 
table below. For further information please contact the providers 
directly; Sirona care and health (hello.sirona@nhs.net) and Clinical 
Partners Contact us | Clinical Partners 
 
 18 

weeks 
and 
under 

19-25 
weeks 

26-51 
weeks 

52-77 
weeks 

78-103 
weeks 

Over 
104 
weeks 

Sirona 
CYP 
ASD 
(February 
2026 
data 
reported 

453 128 629 498 428 1813 

https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information
https://www.awp.nhs.uk/contact-us/freedom-information
mailto:hello.sirona@nhs.net
https://www.clinical-partners.co.uk/contact-us/
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in March 
2026) 

 
As per the previous response FOI.ICB-2526/402: Right to Choose 
Framework for Adult ADHD and Autism Assessments BNSSG ICB 
does not hold waiting list data for providers delivering services in the 
area under Right to Choose.   
 
BNSSG ICB is aware of the following Right to Choose eligible providers 
of adult and CYP Autism assessment: 
 

Adult Autism  CYP Autism 
Atrom Mindcare  Autism 360 

Autism 360  Evolve Psychology 
Axia ASD  Healios 

Dr J & Colleagues  Health Harmonie Minds 
Evolve Psychology  Held Health 

Harley Street Mental Health  Help for Psychology Services 
Healios  KT Healthcare 

Health Harmonie Minds  Oakdale Therapies 
Insight Diagnostics  The Owl Centre 

KT Healthcare   Paloma Health (Your Patient 
Choice Ltd) 

Oakdale Therapies  Problem Shared 
The Owl Centre  Psicon 

Problem Shared  RTN Mental Health Solutions 
T/A RTN Diagnostics 

Psychiatry UK  The Autism Service 

https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
https://bnssghealthiertogether.org.uk/wp-content/uploads/2026/03/FOI.ICB-2526_402-RtC-Framework-for-Adult-ADHD-and-ASD-Assessments-Final-Response.pdf
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RTN Mental Health Solutions 
T/A RTN Diagnostics 

 
 

Sinclair Strong Consultants   
Skylight Psychiatry   
The Autism Service   

 
This list was last updated on 26-27 March 2026. 
 
Some nationally published data may also be helpful: 
https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-
information/publications/statistical/autism-statistics 

3. The average wait time for an assessment for adults and 
children (from referral to assessment). 

The ICB is not able to provide a response to this question for Adults for 
the reasons outlined in the responses to questions 1 and 2. 
 
Average wait times for children’s ADHD and autism assessments can 
be found here: Waiting times - Sirona care & health 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 18 May 2026 and has been approved for release by Helena Fuller, 
Deputy Director of Business, Strategy and Planning for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 

https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fdigital.nhs.uk%2Fdata-and-information%2Fpublications%2Fstatistical%2Fautism-statistics&data=05%7C02%7Clindsay.cox1%40nhs.net%7C3c5880c6d1a241ece72708deb00623f7%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639141737586634720%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=gEhOOd9CPOOOqarrVr6FjcOpDrXTZqlBk5Nq7IsSEBQ%3D&reserved=0
https://gbr01.safelinks.protection.outlook.com/?url=https%3A%2F%2Fdigital.nhs.uk%2Fdata-and-information%2Fpublications%2Fstatistical%2Fautism-statistics&data=05%7C02%7Clindsay.cox1%40nhs.net%7C3c5880c6d1a241ece72708deb00623f7%7C37c354b285b047f5b22207b48d774ee3%7C0%7C0%7C639141737586634720%7CUnknown%7CTWFpbGZsb3d8eyJFbXB0eU1hcGkiOnRydWUsIlYiOiIwLjAuMDAwMCIsIlAiOiJXaW4zMiIsIkFOIjoiTWFpbCIsIldUIjoyfQ%3D%3D%7C0%7C%7C%7C&sdata=gEhOOd9CPOOOqarrVr6FjcOpDrXTZqlBk5Nq7IsSEBQ%3D&reserved=0
https://sirona-cic.org.uk/home/waiting-times/

