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Reference: FOI.ICB-2627/063 
 
Subject: Access Elemental Social Prescribing Case Management System 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

Please include any contracts inherited from predecessor CCG organisations where relevant. 
 
Could you please provide the following information relating to the Access Elemental social prescribing case management system used 
across BNSSG: 

1. Contract start date 
2. Current contract expiry date 
3. The areas this covers 
4. Any available extension options and their durations 
5. Total contract value (annual and/or total) 
6. Procurement route/framework used 
7. Whether a reprocurement or renewal process is planned 

The ICB does not hold this information. The contract for Elemental is 
manged by Sirona care & health. We advise you to contact Sirona 
directly for the information: Sirona.hello@nhs.net 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 20 May 2026 and has been approved for release by Jenny Bowker, 
Deputy Director of Performance Delivery, Primary Care and Children’s Services for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and South 
Gloucestershire ICB. 
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