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Reference: FOI.ICB-2627/076 
 
Subject: Homecare Medicine Services Provider(s) Spend and Activity 

I can confirm that the ICB does not hold the information requested; please see responses below: 
 

QUESTION RESPONSE 

By “clinical homecare medicines services”, I mean services initiated or managed by the ICB which enable patients to receive ongoing 
medicines supply and, where relevant, associated care such as nursing support, patient training, medicine administration, monitoring or 
delivery at home or another non-hospital setting. This includes NHS-funded, manufacturer-funded and mixed-funded homecare 
medicines schemes, where this information is held by the ICB. Examples of clinical homecare providers include Healthnet, Sciensus, 
Lloyds Pharma Clinical Homecare, Alcura. 
 
Under the Freedom of Information Act 2000, I would like to request the following information:  

1. Does your trust employ one or more homecare medicine 
services provider(s) to deliver and/or administer 
medicines to patients in their normal residence?  

If so, what is the name of the provider(s)?  

This information is not held by the ICB. 
 
We advise you to contact the Hospital Trusts and Community 
Provider who may hold this information directly, as follows: 
 

• North Bristol NHS Trust (NBT): Freedom of Information Act 
2000 | North Bristol NHS Trust 

• University Hospitals Bristol and Weston NHS Foundation 
Trust (UHBW): UHBW NHS - Freedom of Information (FOI) 
requests 

• Sirona care and health CIC: Contact Us  

2. Please provide a breakdown on spend by each clinical 
homecare provider for the following NHS financial years: 
FY24, FY25 and FY26 

3. For each provider, how many active patients received 
your homecare medicines service as of 31 March 2024, 
31 March 2025 and 31 March 2026? 

https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information
https://www.nbt.nhs.uk/about-us/information-governance/freedom-information
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
https://www.uhbw.nhs.uk/p/how-we-use-your-data/freedom-of-information-foi-requests
https://sirona-cic.org.uk/contact-sirona/#:%7E:text=0300%20125%206789*-,For%20other%20queries,-%3A
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4. For each provider, please provide a list of medications 
delivered and/or administered through this service as of 
31 March 2024, 31 March 2025 and 31 March 2026? 

5. For each provider, as a proportion of all deliveries, what 
percentage of medicine and ancillaries deliveries were 
late in the most recent reporting period for which you 
have data, and in two comparable reporting periods (eg if 
giving data for March 2026, please also give figures for 
March 2025 and March 2024)? Please state what period 
the figures are for. 

6. Please provide a breakdown of the expenditure (£m) on 
each of the top 10 clinical homecare products/drugs 
dispensed to clinical homecare service users in your 
Trust for the following NHS financial years: FY24, FY25 
and FY26 

 
The information provided in this response is accurate as of 26 May 2026 and has been approved for release by Dr 
Aananthakrishnan Raghuram, Chief Clinical Leadership and Delivery Officer (Medical) for NHS Bristol, North Somerset and 
South Gloucestershire ICB. 
 


